
( KG ) TIMETABLE  FROM 20th April- 24th APRIL 

Note- Submission of activity will help the teacher in marking the attendance, kindly encourage the child to participate in the same. 

Time MONDAY 20 APRIL TUESDAY 21 APRIL WEDNESDAY 22 APRIL THURSDAY 23 
APRIL 

FRIDAY 24 APRIL 

9:00- 
9:30 

"Mother Earth -song for 
Children"  
Prayer on mother 

earth: 
Mother earth 
Mother earth 
Take the seed and give 
it birth 
Father sun, father sun 
gleam and grow 
Until the roots begin to 
grow 
(Recite the rhyme 

feeling the beauty & 
necessity of nature with 
your family members) 

 
Sight words reading : 
(we, do, it, in, can)  
 

Prayer on mother earth 
 

 
 

Sight words reading : 
(we, do, it, in, can) 

Prayer on mother 
earth  

 

Activity on Earth Day 
 
Sow any seed 
eg.green moong, 
coriander, rice etc.in 
a pot or old plastic 
mug or any other pot 
like thing & click the 
picture & send it by 
23rd April 6:00pm  

Gayatri mantra 
Rhyme 
:Tommy's 
thumb is up  

 
 

Make them 
recite it & listen 
them 
attentively 

Gayatri mantra 
Rhyme :We shall 
overcome 

 

Make them recite it & 
listen them attentively 

      



 
9:40 to 
10:15 

 
Maths: missing 
numbers writing 1 to 50 
Hint: parents will write 
numbers from 1 to 50 
leaving some numbers 
in between & the child 
will write the missing 
numbers. For eg. 21 22 
_ 24 _ _ 27 

 

 
English : vowels and 
consonants 
 

 
Story : The blue 
Jackal 
Watch & listen to the 
story & try to narrate 
it by yourself in your 
own style 

 

 

 

 
Hindi: Read & 

recognise 

क से ङ 

 

 

 
PRE-MATHS 

Concept of same - different  

10:25- 
10:55 

Hindi: Introduction of 

क ख ख घ ङ 

Read & recognise 
 
 

Maths: What comes 
after among 1 to 50 for 
eg. 
11 _ 
20 _ 
7 _ 
Give many more 
questions like this 

Maths: What comes 
after among 1 to 50 
for eg. 
26 _ 
34 _ 
43 _ 
Give many more 
questions like this. 

English: 
vowels and 
consonants 
Hint:Say the 
sounds of the 
vowels  & 
make a video 
clip of the 
activity not 
more than 30 
seconds & 
send it by 24th 
April 6:00pm  
 

Craft activity: paper 
snake making 

 

Make a video of the 
activity of not more than 
20 seconds & send it by 
25th April 6:00pm  

      



 
10:55- 
11:30 

 
Lunch break 
Wash hands with soap  

 
Lunch break 
Wash hands with soap  
 

 
Lunch break 
Wash hands with soap  
 

 
Lunch break 
Wash hands with 
soap  

 
Lunch break 
Wash hands with soap  
 

11:30- 
12:00 

Fun activity: 
Jump and count from 1 
to 50 Make a video clip 
of the activity not more 
than 30 seconds & 
send it  
 

Activity: 
Tear & paste 

triangle with red paper, 
square with yellow & 
circle with blue 
Click the picture of the 
activity of your child & 
mail it by 22nd April  

EVS: 
Good habits 

 
 

Maths: 
What comes 
before among 
1 to 50 for eg. 
_ 18 
_ 23 
_ 30 

 
Give many 
more questions 
like this for 
practice 

EVS: Good habits  
 

 


